
S.O.A.P. 
BIBLE READING & JOURNALING 

SCRIPTURE 

Find your scripture reading for today. 
Read slowly and allow God to speak to 
you from what you are reading. Identify 
a verse that was meaningful and write it 
in your journal. 

OBSERVATION 

What caught your attention? How would 
you explain this scripture passage or 
verse to someone else? What is it 
talking about? Write down what you 
observed and rewrite this scripture in 
your own words. 

APPLICATION 

Personalize what you have read. How 
can you apply the scripture to your 
current circumstance? Perhaps it is 
providing instruction, encouragement, a 
promise, or correction in a particular 
area of your life. Write it in your journal 
as an action step. Keep the application 
“SMART” - Specific, Measurable, 
Attainable, Relevant and Time Sensitive.  

PRAYER 

This can be as simple as asking God to 
help you effectively apply or gain greater 
insight of this specific scripture.  
Remember that prayer is a two-way 
conversation. Now, write it out. 

S.O.A.P. 
BIBLE READING & JOURNALING 

SCRIPTURE 

Find your scripture reading for today. 
Read slowly and allow God to speak to 
you from what you are reading. Identify 
a verse that was meaningful and write it 
in your journal. 

OBSERVATION 

What caught your attention? How would 
you explain this scripture passage or 
verse to someone else? What is it 
talking about? Write down what you 
observed and rewrite this scripture in 
your own words. 

APPLICATION 

Personalize what you have read. How 
can you apply the scripture to your 
current circumstance? Perhaps it is 
providing instruction, encouragement, a 
promise, or correction in a particular 
area of your life. Write it in your journal 
as an action step. Keep the application 
“SMART” - Specific, Measurable, 
Attainable, Relevant and Time Sensitive.  

PRAYER 

This can be as simple as asking God to 
help you effectively apply or gain greater 
insight of this specific scripture.  
Remember that prayer is a two-way 
conversation. Now, write it out. 

S.O.A.P. 
BIBLE READING & JOURNALING 

SCRIPTURE 

Find your scripture reading for today. 
Read slowly and allow God to speak to 
you from what you are reading. Identify 
a verse that was meaningful and write it 
in your journal. 

OBSERVATION 

What caught your attention? How would 
you explain this scripture passage or 
verse to someone else? What is it 
talking about? Write down what you 
observed and rewrite this scripture in 
your own words. 

APPLICATION 

Personalize what you have read. How 
can you apply the scripture to your 
current circumstance? Perhaps it is 
providing instruction, encouragement, a 
promise, or correction in a particular 
area of your life. Write it in your journal 
as an action step. Keep the application 
“SMART” - Specific, Measurable, 
Attainable, Relevant and Time Sensitive.  

PRAYER 

This can be as simple as asking God to 
help you effectively apply or gain greater 
insight of this specific scripture.  
Remember that prayer is a two-way 
conversation. Now, write it out. 



 
 

S.P.A.C.E. P.E.T.S. 
 BIBLE STUDY METHOD 

Is there a… 
Sin to confess or repent of? 
Promise to claim? 
Attitude to change or aspire to? 
Command to obey? 
Example to follow or avoid? 

Prayer to pray? 
Error to avoid? 
Truth to believe? 
Something for which to praise God? 

A.C.T.S. - A PRAYER METHOD 

Adoration - Praise the Lord for being  
the awesome God that He is! 

Confession - Admit your sins and  
acknowledge God’s overflowing  

forgiveness and mercy in your life. 

Thanksgiving - Thank God for all the  
wonderful things He has done. 

Supplication - Bring requests for  
yourself and others to God and in all 
things, pray that God’s will be done. 
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